
City of San Antonio Formal Bid Tabulation

Opened: Februrary 28, 2022 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Antifreeze Coolant Midtex Oil, LP Hampel Oil Distributors 

Inc.
Texas Enterprise Inc. 
dba Golden West Oil Co

Cummins Southern 
Plains

Heritage Crystal-Clean Napa Auto Parts Redifuel South Texas Auto Parts 
Co. 

6100015035 SN 3455 IH 35 South 1245 N West Street 3010 Aniol St 6226 N Interstate 35 2175 Point Blvd, Ste 375 6374 Rittiman Rd 4230 Binz-Engelman 20475 Hwy 46W Ste 340

Item Description
Estimated 

Annual
Quantity 

New Braunfels,               
TX 78132
(979) 482-6333

Wichita,                          
KS 67203
(316) 529-1162

San Antonio,                    
TX 78219
(210) 222-0866

San Antonio,                 
TX 78218

Elgin,                                   
IL 60123

San Antonio,                   
TX 78218

San Antonio,                  
TX 78219

Spring Branch,                 
TX 78070

NAS
1 Nitrite Free Bulk 50/50 Prediluted Antifreeze 

Coolant with Delivery Included 4,000

Unit Price Per Gallon: $6.25 $6.65 $8.42 No Bid $5.97 $11.58 $11.01 $10.05
Prompt Pay Discount: 2%
Price Each with Prompt Pay Discount: $9.85
Extended Price Per Gallon $25,000.00 $26,600.00 $33,680.00 $23,880.00 $46,320.00 $44,040.00 $40,200.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bidder 
and local bid

46% 43%

Price Differential $21,320.00 $19,040.00
Manufacturer Shell PATRIOT Old World Crystal Clean Peak Old World Industries, 

LLC./Peak
Chevron

Product Name: Rotella ELC N/F 50/50 NF ELC 50/50 Peak  Final Charge 
Global 50/50

Heavy Duty Global 
Extended Life, Nitrite 

Free OAT, bulk

Antifreeze/Coolant Final Charge Global 
Antifreeze/Coolant

DELO XLC

Part Number: 500009280 999999 FXAB58 234 FXAB58 690825050HF0812 227076BULK

2 Nitrite Free 50/50 Prediluted Antifreeze 
Coolant in 55-gallon drums with delivery 
included

50

Unit Price Per Drum $479.49 $401.25 $464.00 $575.25 $398.25 No Bid $640.20 $594.14
Prompt Pay Discount 2%
Price Each with Prompt Pay Discount: $582.26
Extended Price Per Drum: $23,974.50 $20,062.50 $23,200.00 $28,762.50 $19,912.50 $32,010.00 $29,707.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bidder 
and local bid

30% 37%

Price Differential $3,137.50 $8,700.00 $11,947.50
Manufacturer Shell PATRIOT Old  World Valvoline Crystal Clean Old World Industries, 

LLC/Peak
Chevron

Product Name Rotella ELC N/F 50/50 NF ELC 50/50 Peak Final Charge 50/50 Zerex Heavy Duty Global 
Extended Life, Nitrite 

Free OAT, Drum

Final Charge Global 
Antifreeze/Coolant

DELO XLC

Part Number: 550041811 999999 FXAB57 846438 234A 690825050HF0810 227076 55G

3 Nitrite Free 50/50 Prediluted Antifreeze 
Coolant in 1-gallon jugs with delivery included 2,000

Unit Price Per Jug $11.66 $9.85 $8.59 $10.69 NO BID No Bid $11.99 $10.99
Prompt Pay Discount 2%
Price Each with Prompt Pay Discount $10.77
Extended Price Per Jug $23,320.00 $19,700.00 $17,180.00 $21,380.00 $23,980.00 $21,980.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bidder 
and local bid

28% 20% 28%

Price Differential $3.40 $4,200 $6,800
Manufacturer Shell PEAK Old World Valvoline Old World Industries, 

LLC./Peak
Chevron

Product Name Rotella ELC N/F 50/50 ELC NF 50/50 Peak Final Charge 50/50 Zerex Final Charge Global 
Antofreeze/Coolant

DELO XLC

Part Number 550041810 999999 FXAB53 846437 690825050NF0807 2270761G

4 Deleted

5 Deleted

6 Deleted

Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 2%, 10 days

Estimated Annual Award $72,294.50 $66,362.50 $74,060.00 $50,142.50 $43,792.50 $46,320.00 $100,030.00 $91,887.00

Estimated Annual Award $25,000.00 $20,062.50 $17,180.00


	Final

